



Maryland-National Capital Park and Planning Commission
Corporate Procurement Division
6611 Kenilworth Avenue, Riverdale, MD 20737

BID TABULATION

IFB No. Bid No. B42-149

Supply and Delivery of Sod

RESPONSE DEADLINE: April 19, 2022 at 2:00 pm

Report Generated: Tuesday, April 19, 2022

This notice provides preliminary bid results for the Supply and Delivery of Sod. All bids are subject for further evaluation.

					Bidder Name:		Central Sod Farms		Collins Wharf Sod	
Selected	Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total	Unit Cost	Total		
X	1	Iron Cutter Bermudagrass	100000	Sq. Ft.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.37	\$37,000.00		
X	2	Iron Cutter Bermudagrass Overseeded with Ryegrass	50000	Sq. Ft.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.42	\$21,000.00		
X	3	Tahoma 31 Bermudagrass	100000	Sq. Ft.	\$0.35	\$35,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00		
	4	Tahoma 31 Bermudagrass Overseeded with Ryegrass	50000	Sq. Ft.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00		
	5	Patriot Bermudagrass	50000	Sq. Ft.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00		
	6	Northbridge Bermudagrass	50000	Sq. Ft.	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00		
Total							\$35,000.00		\$58,000.00	

Signed : Cindy Martinez Corporate Procurement Specialist